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Step into the glamorous but treacherous world of Hollywood with Tim
Seeley's captivating thriller, "Money Shot." This gripping tale plunges
readers into the dark underbelly of the entertainment industry, where
dreams collide with ambition and the pursuit of fame can have deadly
consequences.
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In the heart of Los Angeles, amidst the glitz and glamour, lies a hidden
realm of secrets and danger. When a powerful movie producer is found
dead on the set of his latest blockbuster, Detective Sam Riddley finds
himself entangled in a labyrinth of lies and betrayal.

As Sam delves deeper into the investigation, he uncovers a web of
corruption and deceit that extends to the highest echelons of Hollywood.
Ambitious actors, ruthless studio executives, and enigmatic playboys all
become suspects as Sam races against time to find the killer.

Amidst the chaos, Sam encounters Ava Harper, a captivating actress who
holds the key to unraveling the mystery. Together, they navigate the
treacherous waters of Hollywood, dodging paparazzi, informants, and even
assassins.

As the tension mounts, Sam and Ava uncover a scandalous secret that
could topple the entire film industry. The pursuit of justice and the quest for
fame collide in a heart-pounding climax that will leave readers breathless.

"Money Shot" is a masterfully crafted thriller that exposes the dark
underbelly of Hollywood. Tim Seeley's vivid storytelling and intricate
characters paint a gripping portrait of an industry where dreams can turn
into nightmares.

With its fast-paced action, complex characters, and a pulse-pounding plot,
"Money Shot" will keep readers enthralled from start to finish. It is a must-
read for fans of suspense, thrillers, and anyone fascinated by the dark
secrets lurking beneath the glamorous façade of Hollywood.

About the Author: Tim Seeley



Tim Seeley is an award-winning comic book writer and artist known for his
work on titles such as "Grayson," "Revival," and "Hack/Slash." His unique
storytelling style and ability to create complex, memorable characters have
earned him a loyal following among readers and critics alike.

Praise for "Money Shot"

"A gripping thriller that exposes the dark side of Hollywood. Seeley's writing
is sharp, the characters are unforgettable, and the plot twists will keep you
guessing until the very end." - Publishers Weekly

"A must-read for fans of suspense and noir. Seeley captures the essence of
Hollywood's allure and danger, creating a story that is both thrilling and
thought-provoking." - Booklist

"A complex and well-crafted thriller that will leave readers breathless.
Seeley's insider knowledge of the entertainment industry shines through on
every page." - Kirkus Reviews
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